County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers Director
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Amanda McCracken

Email Addresses:
marks@-co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

APRIL 24, 2023

ATTN MARC STEMERMAN ATTN MR ROB SARTWELL ATTN MR KEVIN YOUNGS
CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP MCQUADE & BANNIGAN WHITE CAP
PO BOX 527 22696 MURROCK CIRCLE 30 HILL STREET

ELMIRA NY 14902 WATERTOWN NY 13601 MASSENA NY 13662

BID #2023H-13 NAME: GEOTEXTILES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025
AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION

Dear Mr. Stemerman, Mr. Sartwell, Mr. Youngs:

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are pending:

Purchase Order [ To be issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely, :

7

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

C: Department, Auditor, Bid File, Ferguson Waterworks
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Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591 Senior Account Clerk
_ Avis Gilmore

Buyers Director

Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB Account Clerk

Amanda McCracken
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

APRIL 24, 2023

ATTN LUIS RODRIQUEZ

FERGUSON WATERWORKS

6040 DROTT DRUVE

EAST SYRACUSE NY 13057

BID #2023H-13 NAME: GEOTEXTLES
CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025
AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION

Dear Mr. Rodriguez,

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:
vV W-9 Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached)

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award, please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.
Sincerely,
pYe
— | /|
/ 2/" A (. C \ J /, ol
b laeM ittt o
Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director

MS/kd

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File, Chemung Supply, McQuade & Bannigan, White Cap

SHARED/BIDS/HIGHWAY BID BOOK/2023-2025AWARDS/2023H-13 FERGUSON



BID #2023H-13
GEOTEXTILES
BID TABULATION

PART Il SOIL CONTROL REINFORCEMENT/EROSION ABATEMENT MATERIAL

|

2023-2025 BID PRICING

CHEMUNG SUPPLY CORP FERGUSON WATERWORKS MCQUADE & BANNIGAN WHITE CAP
MANUFACTURER: Not specified ACF ENVIRONMENTAL
BRAND NAME: Not specified ACF ENVIRONMENTAL
|TEM DESCRIPTION RATE ROLL DIMENSIONS PRICE PER ROLL DIMENSIONS PRICE PER ROLL DIMENSIONS PRICE PER ROLL DIMENSIONS PRICE PER
AVAILABLE (LIST) sQ. YD AVAILABLE (LIST) sQ.YD AVAILABLE (LIST) sQ.YD AVAILABLE (LIST) sQ.YD
Erosion Control Matting
Completely Organic 8' X 112.5' 8'X112.5' $0.80 NO BID NO BID
1 Dimension Mesh 8' X112.5' 8' X112.5' $0.35 NO BID NO BID
2 Dimension Mesh 8' X112.5' 8' X112.5' $0.40 NO BID NO BID
3 Dimension Mesh _ 8Xxe675 8' X 112.5' $3.48 NO BID NO BID
Completely Inorganic
8'X112.5' 8'X112.5' 2! NO BID NO BID
(Life Greater Than 3 Years) > > 325
PROXIMAT! APPROXIMATE
Cellular Confinement ROLL DIMENSIONS PRICE PER >vMM%hA___”\,_mw._.m ROLL DIMENSIONS PRICE PER >vmﬂvmﬂ%r”_m_ﬂ<mw._.m ROLL DIMENSIONS PRICE PER >vmmDOC_mmU E ROLL DIMENSIONS PRICE PER mm%c_mmo
System AVAILABLE (LIST, SQ.YD AVAILAB| I SQ.YD AVAILABLE (LIST, . YD AVAILABLE (LIST; SQ.YD
ys (LIsT) Q sQYD LE (LIST) Q SQYD (usT) sQ SQYD (usT) Q SQYD
Cell Seam Peel Strength a'X NL_A._ S241:50 ’
(Greater than 200 Ibs.) Wall e § 6" GEOWEB SIZE PER
= R NO BID NOBID
Thickness (Greater than or 6" Xat'q $314.23 200 REQUEST #1320 2 300
. 8"X21'4" $377.52
equal to 50 mils.)
Soil Reinforcement APPROXIMATE APPROXIMATE APPROXIMATE APPROXIMATE
Mattin GEOGRID $/SY WOVEN $/SY REQUIRED GEOGRID $/SY WOVEN $/SY REQUIRED GEOGRID $/SY WOVEN $/SY REQUIRED GEOGRID $/SY WOVEN $/SY REQUIRED
g SQYD SQYD SQYD sSQYD
Wide Width Tensile Strength Lb./Ft. Minimum (roll direction)
2-3000 $3.60 NO BID 1,000 1,000 NO BID 1,000 NO BID NO BID 1,000
3-4000 $3.75 NO BID 2,000 2,000 $1.92 NO BID 2,000 NO BID NO BID 2,000
4-5000 $3.75 NO BID 5,000 5,000 $1.92 NO BID 5,000 NO BID NO BID 5,000
5-6000 $3.85 NO BID 2,000 2,000 $2.52 NO BID 2,000 NO BID NO BID 2,000
6-7000 $4.10 NO BID 1000 1000 $2.52 NO BID 1000 NOBID NO BID 1000
7-9000 $4.45 NO BID 500 500 $2.76 NO BID 500 NO BID NO BID 500
10,000 and up $5.20 NO BID 500 500 $4.38 NO BID 500 NO BID NO BID 500
J
Comments: . * 3XT, SXT, 7XT, 8XT, 20XT UNIAXIAL GRIDS*
Deviations / , NO NO NO NO
ALL DATAIS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING,
SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS. Hm\_m DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION
'OF BID.RESULTSUNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT i
THIS BID TABULATION-DOES NOT IMPLY'AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.
\.\ ) \ \T\\ \VA..\
7 (\Aﬁuﬂ\\ N~ 3/24/2023
/ PURCHASING DEPT DATE




BID #2023H-13
GEOTEXTILES
BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICING
PART | GEOTEXTILES CHEMUNG SUPPLY FEGUSON WATERWORKS MCQUADE & BANNIGAN 'WHITE CAP
MANUFACTURER: HANES ACF ENVIRONENTAL Not Specified TenCate
BRAND NAME: Not Specified ACF ENVIRONENTAL Not Specified Mirafi
Name of Material Name of Material Name of Material Name of Material
(must be on Roll Dimensions PRICE PER (must beon Roll Dimensions PRICE PER (must be on Roll Dimensions PRICE PER (must be on Roll Dimensions PRICE PER
TION
NYSDOT approved |  Available (List) APFLICATION SQ.YD. | NYSDOT approved | Avallable (uist) APPLICATION Q. YD. NYSDOT approved | Avallable (List) AFELICATION Q. YD. NYSDOT approved | Available (List) AFPLICA Q. YD.
list) list) list) list)
* | EP 12' X 300 B Geotextile Bedding $2.93 | / 12'X 300" ,‘ x A.AA i bl ., ¢ HANES EP 12'X 300 B Geotextile Bedding $2.37 WinfaB 2199 12' x 300" B Geotextile Bedding $3.69
S Geotextile S Geotextile i i i S Geotextile
. g . " : i 3 i i
GS-250 12.5' X 360' ) $0.840 St $0.82 i 50 i 7 i Mirafi 160N 15' x 300 Senartion $1.14
NO.6 25'X360' | D Geotextile Drainage $137 ; i > Ge Drair 106 | Hanesnos b M_MHMM_@ $1.14 Mirafi 160N 15'x300'  |D Geotextile Drainage $1.14
i it
SP Geotextile Slope SP Geotextile Slope S o SP Geotextile Slope
NO.8 5! . R ) . i i : ' ' g
12.5' X 360' Protection $1.98 15' X 300' Brotection $1.30 A 15'X 30 p ton : ) Mirafi 180N 15' x 300’ Protection $1.53
i ST Geotextile B i i ST Geotextile . ST Geotextile
HD .5 g ] g 1 ;] 5" ! K
12.5' X 360 o $1.07 ) 2.5'X 360" | : : e HANES HD Stabilization $0.90 Mirafi 600x 12.5' x 360! P $118
TC Turbidity Curtains NO BID AERFLOTYPE2 . 5'X 50" TC Turbidity Curtains $27.78 CAR 1 ; 4188 TC Turbidity Curtains
TC Turbidity Curtains TC Turbidity Curtains i TC Turbidity Curtains
w/ floatation & NO BID NO BID Indian Valley 6'x50' w/ floatation & $908.11
Weights 6' Weights 6'
R B i
3606-D 452-D 3'X50' SF Silt Fence $54.00 ' X1 SF Silt:Fence NO BID Indian Valley 3'x54 SF Silt Fence $50.38
GM Geomembranes NO BID i el GM ¢ 1 i GM Geomembranes
- i i S i i
¥ PVD Prefabricated R S e PVD Prefabricated PVD Prefabricated
TERRADRAIN 56 4'X50' Vertical Drain with $7.94 ; { 2 h Vertical Drain with NO BID Vertical Drain with
- Connections AR et i i NN i Connections Connections
ted i PCSD Prefabricated PCSD Prefabricated PCSD Prefabricated
Composite Structural NO BID Composite Structural NO BID Site Drain 6'x50' Composite Structural $235.87
g i Drain Drain Drain
B Erosion Control Erosion Control Erosion Control : ;
Logs 12" x " di Logs 12" x dii Logs 12" x
X10' i " X 10" i " X 10" %
10' Am Excelsior 2F200 $3650 10' Am Excelsior 710 $3100 10' Am Excelsior X0 $8333 i
(oe) (0e) (oe) : ik
Erosion Control ! i | bl i Erosion Control Erosion Control
Sediment Logs 20" Y 20" [ d | sediment Logs 20" Sediment Logs 20"
X10' i g i ; "X 10" . "X 10" NO BID
x10' Am Excelsior 207 X0 $54:50 b g i Tt | x10' Am Excelsior 20" X10 $22435 x 10" Am Excelsior 20"X10 °
(0e) ‘ (oe) (ce)
Fabric Check Dai X [ Fabric Check Dam: I Fabric Check Dam: —
Gully Guard or Equal X7 Sediment Only NO BID Gully f . ! Gully Guard or Equal X7 Sediment Only NO BID Gully Guard or Equal X7 Sediment Only NO BID
DrainGuard, i : i DrainGuard, DrainGuard,
X 36" q 36.0 i 3 " X 36" , "X 36"
ik 24" X 36 Drop Inlet Insert $84.00 5 Reisable 24" X 36 Drop Inlet Insert NO BID et 24" X 36 Drop Inlet Insert NO BID
Storm Wattle 9" X25' In Lieu of Silt Fence $41.20 2 fit Fence Storm Wattle 9" X25' In Lieu of Silt Fence $33.97 Storm Wattle 9"X25' In Lieu of Silt Fence NO BID
PART 1 TOTAL BID: $295.384 PART 1 TOTAL BID: $270.41 PART 1 TOTAL BID: $376.37 PART 1 TOTAL BID: $1,228.03
WATERPROOF MEMBRANE ADHESIVE: NO BID WATERPROOF MEMBRANE ADHESIVE: NO BID WATERPROOF MEMBRANE ADHESIVE: NO BID

S:\SHARED\BIDS & QUOTES\A-Z Bids & Quotes\BID BOOK HWY CONSTRUCTION >IU MAINT. MATERIALS EX 4-30-23\Bid Book 2023-2025\Bid Tabulations\2023 Tabulations\2023H-13




