County'of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers
~ Karin Dorr

Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

APRIL 24, 2023

ATTN TIMOTHY EVANS
SCHAEFFER MFG CO
4284 ALTAIR COURSE
LIVERPOOL NY 13090

NOTICE OF AWARD

BID #2023H-24 NAME: ENGINE & HYDRAULIC OIL AND OTHER LUBRICANTS
CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025

AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION

Dear Mr. Evans,

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:

vV W-g Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached)

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

’i’(\, ) Y TR

/ ‘b[\/lL . 2 % . é{/

/ i 9 AN by
ark Sachetti, Purchasiﬁg ir\gctor &
MS/am

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File, Gillees Auto Truck & Marine
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County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers Director
Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Amanda McCracken

Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

APRIL 24,2023

ATTN ADAM GASCON

GILLEE’S AUTO TRUCK & MARINE
36395 STATE RTE 180
LAFARGEVILLE NY 13656

BID #2023H-24 NAME: ENGINE & HYDRAULIC OIL AND OTHER LUBRICANTS

CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025
AWARD: BASED ON LOW BID PER TABULATION

Dear Mr. Gascon,

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full

compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

Submittal Requirements have been met. The following documents are enclosed or pending:

V Purchase Order to be Issued

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

| -
} \! \(;L Ve OO 10

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/am

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File, Schaeffer Mfg

Purchasing/Shared/Bids/Hwy Bid Book/2023-2025/Awards Highway/Award 2023H-24 Gillees



ENGINE AND HYDRAULIC OIL AND OTHER LUBRICANTS

BID #2023H-24

BID TABULATION
FOR THE PERIOD 5/1/23 - 4/30/25

GILLEES AUTO TRUCK AND MARINE

SCHAEFER MANUFACTURING

NYSC #PC39329
SUPERIOR LUBRICANTS
VALID THROUGH 4/19/26

BRAND / BRAND / BRAND /
Item # Bid Item Container size | BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
MANUFACTURER MANUFACTURER MANUFACTURER
Engine Oil
1 40W diesel engine oil 55 Gal. Drum $1,132.00 CITGO 500 HSN NO BID N/A
2 30W diesel engine oil Quart $4.99 CITGO 600 NO BID N/A
3 15/40 Diesel engine oil Cj-4 rating Bulk $13.86/GAL CITGO 600 NO BID N/A
4 15/40 Diesel engine oil Cj-4 rating 55 Gal. Drum $871.86 CITGO 600 NO BID N/A
5 15/40 Diesel engine oil CK-4 rating Bulk $13.86/GAL CITGO 600 NO BID N/A
6 15/40 Diesel engine oil CK-4 rating 55 Gal.Drum $871.86 CITGO 600 NO BID N/A
7 10/30 Diesel engine oil CK-4 rating Synthetic Blend Bulk $14.46/GAL CITGO 600 NO BID N/A
8 10/30 Diesel engine oil CK-4 rating Synthetic Blend 55Gal.Drum $903.66 CITGO 600 NO BID N/A
9 10/30 Diesel engine oil CK-4 rating Synthetic Blend 55 Gal Drum $903.66 CITGO 600 NO BID N/A
io Oil Sample lab analisis service for synthetic blend oils to be NJA
included with Syn-bend oils
1 5W/30 synthetic blend Bulk $12.29/GAL CITGO SUPERGARD NO BID N/A
12 5W/30 synthetic blend 55Gal. Drum $765.37 CITGO SUPERGARD NO BID N/A
13 5W/30 synthetic blend Quart $4.80 NAPA NO BID N/A
14 10W/30 synthetic blend Bulk NO BID NO BID N/A
15 10W/30 synthetic blend 55Gal. Drum $1,127.00 CITGO SUPERGARD NO BID N/A
16 10W/30 synthetic blend Quart $3.99 CITGO SUPERGARD NO BID N/A
17 5W/20 synthetic blend Bulk $12.29/GAL CITGO SUPERGARD NO BID N/A
18 5W/20 synthetic blend 55Gal. Drum $765.37 CITGO SUPERGARD NO BID N/A
19 5W/20 synthetic blend Quart $4.80 NAPA NO BID N/A
20 0W/20 Dexos Full Synthetic Bulk $15.58/GAL CITGO SUPERGARD NO BID N/A
21 oW/20 Dexos Full Synthetic 55Gal. Drum $1,013.15 CITGO SUPERGARD NO BID N/A
22 0W/20 Dexos Full Synthetic Quart $6.67 NAPA NO BID N/A
23 5W/30 Dexos Full Synthetic Bulk $14.53/GAL CITGO SUPERGARD NO BID N/A
24 5W/30 Dexos Full Synthetic 55Gal. Drum $953.58 CITGO SUPERGARD NO BID N/A
25 5W/30 Dexos Full Synthetic Quart $6.67 NAPA NO BID N/A
26 Aviation oil Phillips XC 20/50 12 Qt./Case NO BID NO BID N/A
27 Aviation oil Aeroshell WisW/50 6 Qt./Case NO BID NO BID N/A
28 Aircraft Turbine Engine Lubricating Oil, MIL-PRF-23699 SPEC 24 Qt/Case NO BID NO BID N/A
Hydraulic Oil
29 Universal Tractor Hydraulic oil Bulk $11.36/GAL GILLEES LUBRICANTS NO BID N/A
30 Universal Tractor Hydraulic oil 55Gal. Drum $700.53 GILLEES LUBRICANTS NO BID N/A
31 AW32 premium Hydraulic oil Bulk $10.42/GAL CITGO NO BID N/A
32 AW32 premium Hydraulic oil 55Gal. Drum $619.83 CITGO NO BID N/A

Shared/ B/Bid Book/Hwy/ bid tabs




ENGINE AND HYDRAULIC OIL AND OTHER LUBRICANTS

BID #2023H-24

BID TABULATION
FOR THE PERIOD 5/1/23 - 4/30/25

GILLEES AUTO TRUCK AND MARINE

SCHAEFER MANUFACTURING

NYSC #PC39329
SUPERIOR LUBRICANTS
VALID THROUGH 4/19/26

BRAND / BRAND / BRAND /
Item # Bid Item Container size | BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
MANUFACTURER MANUFACTURER MANUFACTURER
33 AW32LT premium Hydraulic oil Bulk NO BID NO BID N/A
RELIANCE FLUID
TECHNOLOGIES
34 AWS32LT premium Hydraulic oil 55Gal. Drum NO BID NO BID $12.05 MAXXIMUM
PERFORMANCE GMV
LT32
35 Shell Tellus S3v46 55Gal. Drum $1,061.16 CITGO ALL TEMP NZ 46 NO BID N/A
36 Shell Tellus S3V46 5 Gal. Pail $129.91 CITGO ALL TEMP NZ 46 NO BID N/A
37 Dual Range HV ISO 68 55Gal, Drum NO BID NO BID N/A
38 Dual Range HV ISO 68 5 Gal. Pail NO BID NO BID N/A
39 Shell Tellus T-22 55Gal. Drum $1,227.49 CITGO AW CP FLUID NO BID N/A
40 Shell Tellus T-22 5 Gal. Pail $109.99 CITGO AW CP FLUID NO BID N/A
Gear/ Bearing Lube
4 Limited Slip 80W85/90 GL5 55Gal. Drum $1,026.01 GILLEES 80W90 NO BID N/A
42 Limited Slip 80W85/90 GL5 120Lb. Drum $354.19 GILLEES 80W90 NO BID N/A
43 Limited Slip 80W85/90 GL5 5 Gal. Pail $105.82 GILLEES 80W90 NO BID NA
44 Synthetic 75W/90 GL5 55Gal. Drum $2,199.00 CITGO NO BID N/A
45 Synthetic 75W/90 GL5 120Lb. Drum $664.00 CITGO NO BID N/A
46 Synthetic 75W/g90 GL5 5 Gal. Pail $194.90 CITGO NO BID N/A
47 Synthetic 85W/140 GL5 55Gal. Drum $2,258.00 CITGO 80W140 NO BID N/A
48 Synthetic 85W/140 GL5 120Lb. Drum $705.34 CITGO 80W140 NO BID N/A
49 Synthetic 85W/140 GL5 5 Gal. Pail $200.07 CITGO 80Wi40 NO BID N/A
50 Shell Morlina S4 B220 55Gal. Drum $2,802.00 150 CIT::::R SYNHT NO BID N/A
51 Shell Morlina S4 B220 120Lb. Drum NO BID NO BID N/A
Transmission Fluid/oil
52 Shell Morlina S4 B220 5 Gal. Pail $257.15 ¢lreo C'TS::R SYNHT NO BID N/A
53 Dextron Il 55Gal. Drum $880.00 GILLEES MP ATF NO BID N/A
54 Dextron Il 5 Gal. Pail $85.15 GILLEES MP ATF NO BID N/A
GARD SYN
55 Citgo Transgard synthetic 55 Gal. Drum $1,399.00 a0 TRA:‘\? ARDS NO BID N/A
56 Citgo Transgard synthetic 5 Gal. Pail NO BID NO BID N/A
57 Citgo Transgard Mult-purpose 55 Gal. Drum $880.00 GILLEES MP ATF NO BID N/A
58 Citgo Transgard Mult-purpose 5 Gal. Pail $85.15 GILLEES MP ATF NOBID N/A
59 ATF+4 55Gal. Drum $1,841.79 CITGO ATF +4 NO BID N/A
60 ATF+4 5 Gal. Pail NO BID NO BID N/A
61 ATF Dextron VI 55Gal. Drum $1,607.46 CITGO DEXRON VI NO BID N/A
62 ATF Dextron VI 5 Gal. Pail NO BID NO BID N/A
63 ATF Shell Spriax S6 ATF- TES-295 55Gal. Drum $2,192.00  CITGO SYNDURANCE 668 NO BID N/A
64 ATF Shell Spriax S6 ATF- TES-295 5 Gal. Pail $200.90 CITGO SYNDURANCE 668 NO BID N/A
10W CITGO TRANSGARD
< . X NO BID N/A
65 TO-4 10W 55Gal. Drum 4$1,288.06 HD TO -4 [0] /.
10W CITGO TRANSGARD
- . Pai i NO BID N/A
66 TO-4 10W 5 Gal. Pail $119.05 HDTO 4 [¢] /i
67 TO-4 30W 55Gal. Drum $1,306.04 OW CITCO TRANSCARD, NO BID N/A
HDTO -4
30W CITGO TRANSGARD
- 4 § NO BID N/A
68 TO-4 30W 5 Gal. Pail $119.05 HD TO -4 /
69 TO-4 50W 55Gal. Drum $1,359.70 SOWCITGOIRANSGARD NO BID N/A
HDTO -4
. 50W CITGO TRANSGARD
2 3 X NO BID N/A
70 TO-4 50W 5 Gal. Pail $129.00 HD TO -4 o /
71 50W Full Synthetic (Must meet Eaton Roadranger E500 spec) 5 Gal. Pail NO BID NO BID N/A

Shared/ B/Bid Book/Hwy/ bid tabs




BID #2023H-24
ENGINE AND HYDRAULIC OIL AND OTHER LUBRICANTS
BID TABULATION
FOR THE PERIOD 5/1/23 - 4/30/25

GILLEES AUTO TRUCK AND MARINE

SCHAEFER MANUFACTURING

NYSC #PC39329
SUPERIOR LUBRICANTS
VALID THROUGH 4/19/26

BRAND / BRAND / BRAND /
Item # Bid Item Container size | BID PRICE BID PRICE BID PRICE
MANUFACTURER MANUFACTURER MANUFACTURER
Grease
140z Tubes By
.87 EA
72 NGLI #2 Lithium High Pressure Case $49 MYSTIK LITHOPLEX RT 2 $6:87EA/ SCHAEFFER #274 N/A
10 Tubes $206.10/CS-30
65 tubes per case
73 NGLI #2 Lithium High Pressure 5 Gal Pail $199.00 MYSTIK LITHOPLEX RT 2 $246.40 SCHAEFFER #274 N/A
74 NGLI #2 Lithium High Pressure 120Lb. Drum $575.00 MYSTIK LITHOPLEX RT 2 $732.00 SCHAEFFER #274 N/A
140z Tubes By
75 VAL985 Low Temp synthetic Case NO BID $10.33 SCHAEFFER #197 N/A
10 tubes per case
76 VAL985 Low Temp synthetic 5 Gal Pail NO BID $383.20 SCHAEFFER #197 N/A
77 VAL98s5 Low Temp synthetic 120Lb. Drum NO BID $1,134.00 SCHAEFFER #197 N/A
78 Citgo Lithoplex PL Grease - #655538001 5 Gal Pail NO BID $246.40 SCHAEFFER #274 N/A
79 Citgo Lithoplex PL Grease - #655539001 5 Gal Pail $443.28 MISTIK JT6 SYN 460 #00 $246.40 SCHAEFFER #274 N/A
80 Citgo Lithoplex PL Grease - #655540001 5 Gal Pail NO BID $246.40 SCHAEFFER #274 N/A
Anti-Freeze/ Coolant
81 Extended Life Heavy Duty l;r::;:llll:rioad King 9901 Red 50DR or Gallon $11.49 NAPA HD 50/50 NO BID NJA
82 Extended Life Heavy Duty Pre-!f/hx Road King 9901 Red 50DR or 55Gal, Drum $519.00 ROAD KING NO BID NJA
Equivlant
83 Xtrem Blue -20 windshield washer Fluid 1 Gallon/ 6 per Case| $25.14/cs XTREM BLUE NO BID N/A
84 Rain X 2 in 1-25 Degree All Season Windshield washer Fluid 1 Gallon/ 6 per Case| NO BID NO BID N/A
.52/GAL
85 Diesel Exhaust Fluid 2.5 Gal Jug $13.29 OILzZUM NO BID 55513l80 GULF DEF
" . NO BID & MAXXIMUM
86 Diesel Exhaust Fluid 55Gal. Drum $219.00 OILZUM 7335 PERFORMANCE DEF
) ) 5 43,65 MAXXIMUM
87 Diesel Exhaust Fluid 250 Gal. Tote/ Bulk $2.77 OolLZUM NO BI 3. PERFORMANCE DEF
. . . . NO BID N/A MAXXIMUM
88 Power Service Diesel Fuel Supplement & Cetaine Boose 2.5lb Containger $149.00 POWER SERVICE [o] PERFORMANCE DEF
Vendor will supply and install one 330 gallon bulk tote for
Highway and one 330 gallon bulk tote for Solid Waste. Each
tote must include a dispensing unit with meter and a 25 foot
retractable dispensing reel. All hardware must be D.E.F
compatible. One additional bulk tote will be supplied to
Highway for a reserve. Dispensing equipment will not be
necessary for this reserve tote
All DEF equipment will be serviced and maintained by the
vendor.
DEVIATIONS NO NO
COMMENTS:

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS.
THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT.
THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED.

Ranie Dowe

PURCHASING

4/11/23
DATE
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