County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591

Buyers
Karin Dorr

Amanda McCracken

Director
Mark Sachetti, CPPB

Email Addresses:
marks@co.jefferson.ny.us
karind@co.jefferson.ny.us

amccracken@co.jefferson.ny.us
avisg@co.jefferson.ny.us
mshear@co.jefferson.ny.us

Senior Account Clerk
Avis Gilmore

Account Clerk
Mary Ann Shear

APRIL 24, 2023

ATTN WAYNE WHITE
ALL SEASONS LANDSCAPING
& GARDENING CTR, LLC

NOTICE OF AWARD

ATTN JUSTIN BUSH
SEEDWAY LLC
219 LAMSON STREET

4784 STATE RT 12 SYRACUSE NY 13206
LOWVILLE, NY 13367

BID #2023H-6 NAME: NURSERY STOCK PLANTINGS, FERTILIZER AND GRASS SEED
CONTRACT PERIOD: MAY 1, 2023 THROUGH APRIL 30, 2025
Dear Mr. White & Mr. Bush,

| am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid.

The following documents are required before a Contract/Purchase Order is issued:
vV W-g Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached
V Insurance Certificate - Commercial General Liability, Business Automobile Liability
V Proof of New York State Disability/Worker’s Compensation
V Other: Please note that Jefferson County must be listed on your Insurance certificates as an additional
insured as noted in the bid document under Insurance Requirements.

If you have any questions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

Sincerely,

Mark Sachetti, Purchasing Director
MS/kd

Enclosure: Wage Rates

C:  Department, Auditor, Bid File
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BID #2023H -6

NURSERY STOCK PLANTINGS, FERTILZER AND GRASS SEED

BID TABULATION

2023-2025 BID PRICING

ALL SEASON'S LANDSCAPING & GARDEN CTR, LLC SEEDWAY LLC
ITEM ~ HEIGHT 47105 5'TO 6' -
CONIFERS
Pine, White $250.00 $250.00 NO BID
Spruce, Blue $250.00 $250.00 NO BID
Spruce, Norway $250.00 $250.00 NO BID
ORNAMENTAL FRUIT TREES
(Low Growing - Assoted, Example, plum, pear, apple etc $55.00 NO BID
HARDWOQOODS CALIPER 11/2"-2" -21/2"
Crimson King $315.00 $335.00 NO BID
Maple, Red $315.00 $335.00 NO BID
Maple, Silver $315.00 $335.00 NO BID
Maple, Sugar $315.00 $335.00 _ _NOoBID
Maple, Varigated $315.00 $335.00 NO BID
Oak, Red $315.00 $335.00 NO BID
Weeping Willow $315.00 $335.00 NO BID
Mountain Ash $315.00 $335.00 NO BID
Species: PRICE PLANTED PRICE PLANTED
SHRUBS 2'-3 } 3-4
Barberry $42.00 $55.00 NO BID B
Dogwood $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Burning Bush $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Lilac, Purple $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Lilac, White $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Snowball Bush $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Spirea White $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Privet (Ligustrum) $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Dwarf Cedar $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Dwarf Spruce $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Blackberry Shrub $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Blueberry Shrub $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Raspberry Shrub $42.00 $55.00 NO BID
Price for plantings to include 1 year replacement guarantee.
FERTILIZER and GRASS SEED
20 gal upright 20 gal flat
Waterting Bladders for Trees: $35.00 $35.00 NO BID
Schedule C - Grass Seed per spec: $4.00/1b $2.17/Ib
Schedule D - Grass Seed per spec: $4.00/;b $2.41/Ib
Fertilizer, per hundredweight $70.00 lawn starter application $45.00
Fertilizer, per hundredweight $70.00 late season application NO BID
Fertilizer, per hundredwelight $70.00 vialterisl ublestor $160.00
hydroseeder
Mulch for Hydroseeder $27.50 50lb package $21.00
DEVIATIONS:
COMMENTS:

ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DOCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING,

SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS. THIS DATA SHOULD NOT BE INTERPRETED

AS CONFIRMATION OF BID,RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT THIS BID TABULATION DOES NOT IMPLY AN AWARD

HAS BEEN MAlﬁE UNLESS NOTED.
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